

Products	Central Poly Corp	Tronex	Fordian Packaging	Jersey Paper	General Chemical	Cross Country	Interline Brands
Antibacterial Lotion Soap 1 gal	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 17.64	\$ 19.96	\$ 19.80	\$ 33.40
Wall Mounted Hand Soap Dispenser	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 22.00	\$ 22.70	\$ 17.85	\$ 15.00
Premium Single Roll Bath Tissue 2 Ply	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 42.48	\$ 33.48	no bid	\$ 45.39
2 Ply Jumbo Roll Bath Tissue	\$ 21.95	no bid	no bid	\$ 18.24	\$ 18.48	\$ 18.48	\$ 23.00
Wall Mounted Toilet Paper Dispenser	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 5.00	\$ 25.00	no bid	\$ 5.00
Heavy Duty Wall Mount Toilet Paper Disp.	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 64.00	\$ 46.60	no bid	\$ 64.00
Bleach 6 gal per case	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 8.34	\$ 8.94	\$ 8.40	\$ 11.16
Brooms - Corn & Blended	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 33.36	\$ 52.80	\$ 33.60	\$ 37.32
Counter Cloth/Bar Mops	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 17.00	\$ 20.95	no bid	\$ 27.20
Chlorinate Foam Food Degreaser	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 33.80	\$ 42.50	no bid	\$ 44.99
Lobby Dust Pan 6 ea per case	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 37.50	\$ 32.40	\$ 42.00	\$ 54.84
Glass Cleaner Wipes 500 count	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 31.27	\$ 38.29	\$ 36.05	\$ 53.76
Latex Gloves - Nitrate (disp)	no bid	\$ 35.10	no bid	\$ 39.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 36.20	\$ 46.50
Latex Gloves - Synthetic (disp)	no bid	\$ 23.60	no bid	\$ 39.00	\$ 33.00	\$ 17.50	\$ 46.90
Leather Palm Knit Gloves 12 per case	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 29.04	\$ 17.88	\$ 16.68	\$ 18.60
Liner - 40 x 48 14 MIC Blue 250 cs	\$ 17.90	no bid	\$ 16.80	\$ 31.40	\$ 17.85	\$ 26.50	\$ 42.98
Clear Ammonia 4 gal per case	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.92	\$ 13.48	\$ 12.52	\$ 11.76
Mop Heads, Loop End, 24 oz	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 46.68	\$ 49.08	\$ 46.68	\$ 32.40
Multifold Paper Towel 6 ea. per case	\$ 15.60	no bid	no bid	\$ 14.94	\$ 14.00	\$ 14.18	\$ 30.41
Premium Folded Towel 12 ea. Per case	\$ 15.70	no bid	no bid	\$ 49.80	\$ 32.00	\$ 24.95	\$ 38.45
Blue Contour Trigger Sprayer Tube (250)	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 102.00	\$ 164.00	\$ 237.50	\$ 135.00
Urinal Blocks with Screens	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$ 10.56	\$ 10.56	\$ 11.40	\$ 18.00

Note: MB and Companies did not sign mandatory bid document resulting in automatic rejection of their bid

Note: Unipak did not sign mandatory bid document resulting in automatic rejection of their bid